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Diverse and abundant, marine-derived bioactive compounds offer a plethora of pharmacologically active
agents with the potential to produce valuable therapeutic entities. Marine-derived organisms, including some
macroalgae, microalgae, blue-green algae, invertebrates, and vertebrates?valued in traditional Chinese
medicine since ancient times?are now recognized as rich sources of pharmaceutically active compounds.
These factors, coupled with the growing need for novel bioactives for the treatment of severe human diseases
such as cancer, diabetes, microbial infections, and inflammatory processes, has brought marine
pharmaceuticals to the forefront of pharmacology.

Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications provides a comprehensive account of marine-derived
bioactive pharmaceuticals and their potential health benefits, including antioxidant, anticancer, antiviral,
anticoagulant, antidiabetic, antiallergy, anti-inflammatory, antihypertensive, antibacterial, and
radioprotective activities. Moreover, it discusses the sources, isolation and purification, chemistry,
functionality interactions, applications, and industrial features of a variety of marine-derived
pharmaceuticals.

Marine pharmacognosy is a dynamic field that has been systematically investigated over the last 50 years,
and the number of publications and patents are increasing every year. Bringing together a global team of
experts, Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications reviews current research on marine-derived
bioactive compounds and provides insight into future research on their potential as pharmacologically active
agents.
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From reader reviews:

Dolores Mika:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby will be reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications.

Colin Rousey:

The book Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting stress
or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Marine Pharmacognosy:
Trends and Applications to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable,
increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like wide open and
read a e-book Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Brian Register:

The guide untitled Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications is the publication that recommended to
you you just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The
language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of
exploration when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate.
You also can get the e-book of Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications from the publisher to make
you more enjoy free time.

Nancy Maxfield:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the Marine Pharmacognosy: Trends and Applications when you needed it?
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