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Pablo Neruda's Veinte poemas de amor y una canción desesperada (1924) is the most widely read and best
loved book of poetry ever written in Spanish. Its verses can be recited by heart by millions of Latin
Americans from every background and walk of life, and it has become almost a bible for young lovers.

Yet despite, or perhaps because of this immense popular success, it has received scant attention from
scholars, often being studied out of context and in relatively superficial fashion. This new critical edition -
the first to include critical notes in English - argues that the book constitutes a critical juncture in the young
Neruda's development as a poet, and that the poems are as much painstakingly wrought experiments in style,
language and form as they are outpourings of youthful passion. A detailed introduction in English
demonstrates that the Viente poemas represent the culmination of complex and sometimes fraught poetic
apprenticeship, significant traces of which can be found in the poems themselves. This is followed by a
series of commentaries which offer close readings of all twenty-one poems, an extensive bibliography, a
selected vocabulary, and a list of key rhetorical and metrical terms.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Dunn:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question
simply because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
right. Because start from on pre-school until university need this Veinte poemas de amor y una canción
desesperada (Hispanic Texts MUP) to read.

Helen Woodson:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve
that need more time to be learn. Veinte poemas de amor y una canción desesperada (Hispanic Texts MUP)
can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.

Michael Fischer:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this guide. This Veinte poemas de amor y una canción
desesperada (Hispanic Texts MUP) is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train
and soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-
book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Kyle Smallwood:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying down
on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Veinte poemas de amor y una canción desesperada
(Hispanic Texts MUP) can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have
than the others?
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