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Although current environmental debates lay the focus on the Industrial Revolution as a sociopolitical
development that has led to the current environmental crisis, many ecocritical projects have avoided
historicizing their concepts or have been characterized by approaches that were either pre-historic or post-
historic: while the environmental movement has harbored the dream of restoring nature to a state untouched
by human hands, there is also the pessimistic vision of a post-apocalyptic world, exhausted by humanity’s
consumption of natural resources. Against this background, the decline of nature has become a narrative
template quite common among the public environmental discourse and environmental scientists alike. The
volume revisits Antiquity as an epoch which witnessed similar environmental problems and came up with its
own interpretations and solutions in dealing with them. This decidedly historical perspective is not only
supposed to fill in a blank in ecocritical discourse, but also to question, problematize, and inform our
contemporary debates with a completely different take on “nature” and humanity’s place in the world.
Thereby, a productive dialogue between contemporary ecocritical theories and the classical tradition is
established that highlights similarities as well as differences. This volume is the first book to bring
ecocriticism and the classical tradition into a comprehensive dialogue. It assembles recognized experts in the
field and advanced scholars as well as young and aspiring ecocritics. In order to ensure a dialogic exchange
between the contributions, the volume includes four response essays by established ecocritics which embed
the sections within a larger theoretical and practical ecocritical framework and discuss the potential of
including the pre-modern world into our environmental debates.
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From reader reviews:

Sang O\'Connor:

Here thing why this Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice)
are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content
of computer which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of
Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice) giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can
find any publication out there but there is no guide that similar with Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures
of Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes
about the thing that happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily
bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be
having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of
Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice) in e-book can be your substitute.

Michael Patterson:

The book untitled Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice)
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book
was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this
book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site
and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Maxine Whitley:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory
and Practice) this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This kind of
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why
this book suitable all of you.

Joshua White:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of
Antiquity (Ecocritical Theory and Practice) to make your reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading



expertise is developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you
just read it and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to
like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book Ecocriticism, Ecology, and the Cultures of Antiquity
(Ecocritical Theory and Practice) can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse in what
must you're doing of these time.
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