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The perfect hardcover gift book for anyone head-over-hooves for unicorns, flying horses, or little
ponies!

"For all those little lords and ladies who adore unicorns, this book is the bedtime story for them! The
illustrations are top-notch and beautifully colored. The prose is perfect. Highly recommended." — The
Children's Book Review

As night falls in the enchanted forest, the unicorns and their friends gather to get ready for bed. Say
goodnight to all the types of unicorns — the pearly-whites, the foals, the oldens, the fluffies, the jet-blacks,
the cuties, and more — as well as the wonderful beings who attend them, from rainbows and fairies to baby
dragons and, of course, the full moon.

Readers who've always wondered about unicorn habits, what a group of unicorns is called, and other
mysteries will also be captivated by the fun unicorn facts that follow the story.

It's a magical, fantasy bedtime story for unicorn lovers young and young-at-heart! Grown-up fans of My
Little Pony, The Last Unicorn, and Lisa Frank will treasure this book just as much as the new generation of
unicornophiles!
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From reader reviews:

Alexander Macdougall:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Goodnight Unicorn: A Magical Parody. Try to make the book Goodnight
Unicorn: A Magical Parody as your close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you
experience alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned
for you personally. The book makes you more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So
, we should make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Jon Cerrone:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while
is reading. Sure, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Goodnight Unicorn:
A Magical Parody book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than
just a book.

Maria Tate:

Why? Because this Goodnight Unicorn: A Magical Parody is an unordinary book that the inside of the
reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside. Reading this
book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside
of easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains
than the other book possess such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking technique. So
, still want to hold up having that book? If I have been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Richard Harden:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount
types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually Goodnight Unicorn: A
Magical Parody.
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