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Art therapists work with a range of distinct philosophical and theoretical underpinnings, but as yet there has
been no single book to offer an overview of these theories. Art Therapy Theories provides an introductory,
non-partisan overview of art therapy theories outlining the following therapy approaches:?

Cognitive Behavioural Art Therapy

Solution-Focused Brief Therapy

Psychoanalytical (Freudian) Art Therapy

Analytical (Jungian) Art Therapy

Gestalt Art Therapy

Person-Centred or ‘Rogerian’ Art Therapy

Mindfulness Art Therapy

Integrative Art Therapy (the Group-Interactive Model)

Feminist Art Therapy

Art Therapy as Social Action



Art Therapy as a Research Tool

Each chapter provides a non-judgemental, yet analytical, synopsis of each approach. No detailed knowledge
is necessary to understand the different approaches, as the book explains them in clear and concise English.
Difficult terms and concepts are explained as they arise, and a glossary of terms is also provided.

Art Therapy Theories is aimed at trainee art therapists who need to demonstrate that they have a grasp of
theory, as well as a sense of how the theory can translate into practice. It will also appeal to seasoned
therapists, counsellors and to a wide range of professionals in the mental health field.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Jennings:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Art Therapy
Theories: A Critical Introduction? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with the
opinion or you have various other opinion?

Laura Hargis:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They must answer that question
because just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Art Therapy Theories: A Critical Introduction
to read.

George Hale:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find publication that need more time to be examine. Art Therapy Theories: A Critical Introduction can be
your answer given it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.

Jordan Miller:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or created from each source this filled update of news. With
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking
the Art Therapy Theories: A Critical Introduction when you needed it?
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