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Places—buildings, neighborhoods, landmarks, and cultural and commercial institutions—help define a city's
unique character, its "sense of place." This is the key concept behind Placenotes, a wholly new type of travel
book that features the "one of a kind" places that make a city distinctive. This set of Placenotes guides you to
places where you can experience the authentic culture of Houston. For visitors, these are the "must see"
places. For Houston residents, Placenotes offers the perfect opportunity to become deeply acquainted with
the places that distinguish their city from all others—an opportunity to invest in the life of the place.

Not a conventional travel book, Placenotes—Houston is a set of individual cards that describe forty-seven
unique places in the city. The front of each card has a color photograph that captures the spirit of a particular
place. The back of the card tells the story of the place, often with commentary by a local expert. It also
provides all the practical details people need to plan their visit. A Houston map, index of places, and key to
symbols card comes in the set. The cards are contained in a sturdy box with a lid that snaps shut with
invisible magnets.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Matlock:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an individual is
you don't know what one you should start with. This Placenotes_Houston is our recommendation to help you
keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Bobby Phillips:

Precisely why? Because this Placenotes_Houston is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting
for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who else write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of
not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of gains
than the other book possess such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking method. So , still
want to postpone having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Linda Howard:

Placenotes_Houston can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight
away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort that will put
every word into delight arrangement in writing Placenotes_Houston however doesn't forget the main level,
giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be among it. This
great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

Verna Hibbard:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Placenotes_Houston can be the reply, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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