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Since the production of the first negative by William Henry Fox Talbot in Wiltshire’s Lacock Abbey in
1835, English photography has played a central role in revolutionizing the production of images, yet it has
largely evaded critical attention. The Making of English Photography investigates this new enterprise—and
specifically how professional photographers shaped a strange aesthetic for their practice.

The Making of English Photography examines the development of English photography as an industrial,
commercial, and (most problematically) artistic enterprise. Concentrating on the first decades of
photography’s history, Edwards tracks the pivotal distinction between art and document as it emerged in the
writings of the “men of science” and professional photographers, suggesting that this key opposition is
rooted in social fantasies of the worker. Through a close reading of the photographic press in the 1860s, he
both reconstructs the ideological world of photographers and employs the unstable category of photography
to cast light on art, class, and industrial knowledge.

Bringing together an array of early photographs, recent historical and theoretical scholarship, and extensive
archival sources, The Making of English Photography sheds new light on the prevailing discourses of
photography as well as the antinomies of art and work in a world shaped by social division.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Glass:

The particular book The Making of English Photography: Allegories has a lot of knowledge on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous
author. The author makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after perusing this book.

Graciela Tubbs:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The
Making of English Photography: Allegories provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Marie Clayton:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Making of English
Photography: Allegories which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Howard Benedict:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book but in addition novel and The Making of English Photography:
Allegories or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book,
you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or perhaps students
especially. Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In other case, beside science publication,
any other book likes The Making of English Photography: Allegories to make your spare time far more
colorful. Many types of book like here.
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