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You'll be delighted by the antics of Tilly and Elmer, a pair of frisky sexagenarians from the Midwest, and I
hope you'll enjoy applying your creative talents to showing them to be the colorful characters they are. The
30 drawings in this book are based on a selection of illustrations from "The Sexy Seniors of South Branch", a
collection of sweet and funny short stories recounting their adventures and misadventures. This book will be
especially fun for grownups who have never really grown up! Tilly and Elmer have been married for close to
fifty years, they're still in love, and they know what to do about it. They would appear to the casual observer
to be the definition of an “old married couple”; but while they ARE a couple, AND married, they don’t
consider themselves OLD. In fact, they still feel like teenagers most of the time, although sometimes events
remind them that they aren’t quite as athletic, skinny, or flexible as they were five decades ago. No matter.
They try to recapture their youth anyway; and when they can’t quite recapture it, they at least give it a good
chase. Along the way, they have some fun and get themselves into, and usually out of, some hilarious
situations. What they’ve lost over the years in body tone, they've gained in expertise, imagination, and good
humor; after all, you don't have to be young to be in love and enjoy your share of "quality time" together.
The selected illustrations in The Sexy Seniors of South Branch Coloring Book are sweet, funny, nostalgic,
and just a little racy. If you find yourself falling in love with Tilly and Elmer, well, you won't be the first!
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Smith:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy
read one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The particular The Sexy Seniors of South Branch
Coloring Book (Tilly and Elmer) is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Daniel McCullough:

The guide untitled The Sexy Seniors of South Branch Coloring Book (Tilly and Elmer) is the book that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The
language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was
did a lot of study when write the book, hence the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate.
You also will get the e-book of The Sexy Seniors of South Branch Coloring Book (Tilly and Elmer) from the
publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Marina Espinal:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Sexy Seniors of South
Branch Coloring Book (Tilly and Elmer) can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out
of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?

Mary Abrams:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That The Sexy Seniors of South Branch Coloring Book
(Tilly and Elmer) can give you a lot of good friends because by you investigating this one book you have
factor that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that might be your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than some other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let's have The Sexy Seniors
of South Branch Coloring Book (Tilly and Elmer).
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