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Did you know that you will soon be living in a world where: There are no checks, coins or paper money? All
your money will exist only as electronic ones and zeros stored in computers? There is an impenetrable wall
between you and your wealth? There is no privacy? All buying and selling must be approved? The world's
economy and even your personal finances are controlled by one entity? Are you ready for the world's new
economic system? Prepare now, because ready or not, here it comes! Glenn Guest has served as a pastor for
over 24 years and has also had a career in military and industrial electronics. These two experiences have
complimented one another to give Pastor Guest a unique perspective of prophetic scriptures and world
events. Over the years the Lord has given Pastor Guest the privilege of teaching many classes on end time
events and the Book of Revelation. He conducts classes in churches, schools, on radio and other venues as
the Lord gives him the opportunity. www.stepstowardthemark.com
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Bates:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book called Steps Towards the
Mark of the Beast: The Christian's Guide to the How and Why of the Coming Cashless/ RFID Economic
System? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time using your
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have different opinion?

Mary Wines:

The book Steps Towards the Mark of the Beast: The Christian's Guide to the How and Why of the Coming
Cashless/ RFID Economic System has a lot associated with on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily after perusing this
book.

Melinda Brown:

The reason? Because this Steps Towards the Mark of the Beast: The Christian's Guide to the How and Why
of the Coming Cashless/ RFID Economic System is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting
for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it
was fantastic author who have write the book in such wonderful way makes the content on the inside easier
to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of advantages
than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking technique. So , still
want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Heather Vazquez:

Steps Towards the Mark of the Beast: The Christian's Guide to the How and Why of the Coming Cashless/
RFID Economic System can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in words, easy to
understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to
place every word into delight arrangement in writing Steps Towards the Mark of the Beast: The Christian's
Guide to the How and Why of the Coming Cashless/ RFID Economic System but doesn't forget the main
position, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be among it.
This great information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial contemplating.
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