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Synopsis: An offbeat dramatic love story with plenty of dark comedy, THE BOOKS chronicles the
developing relationship of a professional dominatrix, Mistress Chimera, and her agoraphobic client, Mark.
After Mark loans her a copy of James Joyce’s "Dubliners," their personal relationship deepens, complicating
their sadomasochistic rituals. Before the couple can truly fall in love, they both must accept that some people
may never fit into society.

Cast Size: 1 Male, 1 Female, 2 Off-stage voices

"The post-golden-shower-literary-discussion romantic dramedy you've been waiting for." - The Village
Voice

FOUR STARS - Time Out New York

"surprisingly engrossing and ultimately touching." - Backstage
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From reader reviews:

Cassandra Martin:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this particular aren't like that. This The Books book is readable simply by you who hate the
perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving
even decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer of The Books content conveys thinking
easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Books is not loveable to be your top listing
reading book?

Juan Harrell:

The actual book The Books has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research previous to
write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after looking over this book.

Olive Wilson:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we
will say absolutely yes. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you
got when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read is The Books.

Alexander Snider:

The book untitled The Books contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the woman idea
with easy approach. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to
read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary
works. You can easily read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or device, so you can
read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official
web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.
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