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Troy Thompson's Excellent Poetry Book follows Troy Thompson, a Year 6 student in Ms. Kranke's English
class in Dagaburra, Australia. Read his assignments, his work, his teacher's comments, and step into the head
of a twelve-year-old Australian boy as he has his first experience with poetry.Moving, silly (and sometimes
just a little gross), Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book is more than an introduction to poetry for
children. It can be read as a narrative, or used as an easy-to-follow classroom guide for teachers. Divided into
assignnments and peppered with Troy's own doodles and margin comments, poetry (or peotry) has never
been so much fun.Whether he's dedicating a ballad to his girlfriend Kylie or revealing the heroic and moving
death of his policeman father, Ms. Kranke obviously has a great deal of affection for both Troy and his
poems - someting readers will understand perfectly.In this painless introduction to poetry -- sorry, peotry --
Aussie sixth-grader Troy Thompson does his best to keep up with Ms. Kranke's assignments on, variously,
the haiku, the ballad, the limerick, the sonnet, occasional poems, concrete poetry, the ode and the acrostic.
Ms. Kranke's encouraging instructions are juxtaposed to hilarious effect with Troy's scatalogical word lists,
wild illustrations and manful efforts to actually write poems. - Washington Post, Aug. 24, 2003 (hardcover)
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Tyson:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important usually. The book Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book had been making you to
know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages
for you. The guide Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book is not only giving you far more new information
but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your
guide. Try to make relationship with all the book Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book. You never truly
feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Nick Peoples:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book book is readable by means of you
who hate those straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer regarding
Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book content conveys prospect easily to understand by lots of people.
The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different available as it. So , do you
even now thinking Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book is not loveable to be your top listing reading
book?

Mary Stone:

The knowledge that you get from Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book could be the more deep you
excavating the information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to understand but Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book giving you buzz feeling of
reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood through anyone who
read this because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We highly recommend you for having that Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book
instantly.

Marline Deluca:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name Troy
Thompson's Excellent Peotry Book suitable to you? Often the book was written by popular writer in this era.
The particular book untitled Troy Thompson's Excellent Peotry Bookis the one of several books that
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this
publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in
the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this guide. This book will give you
a lots of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world on this book.
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