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Marie Tremaine's bibliography was originally published by University of Toronto press in 1952 and has been
described as 'the cornerstone of bibliography and book history studeis in Canada.' This supplement corrects
the original books and adds considerably to its contents. In addition to verifying as many of Tremaine's
original library locations as possible, and identifying additional copies of the items, the authors have added
the many new entries that have come to light in the last forty-five years

The new work is an analytical bibliography of previously unrecorded eighteenth-century Canadian imprints
and a source for the study of early print culture in the Maritimes, Quebec, and Ontario. The definition of
imprint has been extended to encompass all products of the press, from books and official documents to job
printing such as handbills, commercial notices, licences, and land grants. The work includes a transcription
of the accountsof more than thirty years of book and job printing from the Brown Neilson office in Quebec
City, the most extensive collection of business records left by an early Canadian print shop.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Howell:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this A Bibliography of
Canadian Imprints, 1751-1800 book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Vicki Head:

The guide with title A Bibliography of Canadian Imprints, 1751-1800 includes a lot of information that you
can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Rex Oswald:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
lots of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book you have
read will be A Bibliography of Canadian Imprints, 1751-1800.

Patrick Leon:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This A Bibliography of Canadian
Imprints, 1751-1800 is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train as well as soon.
If you did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make
you better to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.
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