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The current Army Profession campaign makes the case for a re-evaluation and assessment of the Army as a
profession and the attributes of the Army Professional. Leadership entails the repetitive exercise of
discretionary judgments, all highly moral in nature, and represents the core function of the Army
Professional’s military art. Leader development is an investment required to maintain the Army as a
profession. The profession is maintained by leaders who place a high priority on leader development and
invest themselves and the resources of the profession to develop professionals and future leaders at all levels.
This project outlines a model for leader development anchored in learning agility and the notion that learning
agile leaders apply previous learning and embrace learning in new, novel, or ill-defined environments.
Learning agile leaders are adaptable. These leaders see actions that are different from the norm and readjust
in an appropriate manner. If mission command is the operating principle for the Army and given the context
of today’s operational environment, then adaptable leaders are an absolute necessity. Leader development
systems must enhance and maximize one’s motivation and ability to develop, and the overall Army culture
must be supportive of such a process.
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From reader reviews:

Marian Sheffield:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This Leader Development, Learning Agility,
and the Army Profession is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Gloria Taylor:

The book Leader Development, Learning Agility, and the Army Profession will bring you to the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book Leader Development, Learning Agility, and
the Army Profession is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the
official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Whitney Ortez:

The e-book with title Leader Development, Learning Agility, and the Army Profession posesses a lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist
new understanding the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently.
That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout
new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere
you want.

Kari Hughes:

The reason why? Because this Leader Development, Learning Agility, and the Army Profession is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with
the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret
it. This excellent book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help improving your
ability and your critical thinking way. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the
e-book store hurriedly.
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