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If you're interested in expanding the usable living space in your home -- and boosting its value -- finishing
your basement is a smart way to make it happen.

In this new and revised edition of Remodeling a Basement, you'll find a wide range of inspiring design ideas
for turning your basement into a comfortable, functional space the whole family can enjoy.

From cover to cover, you'll get all the expert advice, inside tips, and step-by-step instructions you'll need to
make your vision a reality. All brought to you in clear, accessible language -- and lots of valuable photos and
drawings -- by a consummate professional.

In this comprehensive volume -- the latest in our popular Build Like A Pro series -- professional contractor
Roger German takes you through the entire process of remodeling a basement.

From family rooms, bathrooms and laundry rooms to workshops and hobby rooms, he shows you how to
build a whole new level of comfort into your house.

Here's an example of the timely, in-depth information you'll find.

Every construction detail is updated to reflect the latest building code●

All the basic construction techniques you'll need are here●

Nuts and bolts information about wiring, plumbing, windows and doors●

Brand new content about egress windows●

How to tackle common basement building challenges, like framing on concrete, evacuating water, and●

working around heating and plumbing fixtures

For proactive homeowners and contractors alike, this updated reference book is the only resource you'll need
to get the job done right the first time.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Gann:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Remodeling a Basement: Revised Edition
(Taunton's Build Like a Pro) e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that
may be understand by anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Remodeling a Basement:
Revised Edition (Taunton's Build Like a Pro) as good book not simply by the cover but also through the
content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing an
additional sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why
you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Lily Winstead:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When
you learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Remodeling a Basement: Revised Edition (Taunton's Build Like a Pro) provide you
with new experience in reading a book.

Donald Scott:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. That Remodeling a Basement: Revised Edition (Taunton's Build
Like a Pro) can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have thing that they
don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for
you to get success. This guide offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Remodeling a
Basement: Revised Edition (Taunton's Build Like a Pro).

Marilyn Calhoun:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of
book Remodeling a Basement: Revised Edition (Taunton's Build Like a Pro). You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make a person happier to
read. It is most significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a
other place.
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