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Although the emergence of the English novel is generally regarded as an eighteenth-century phenomenon,
this is the first book to be published professing to cover the 'eighteenth-century English novel' in its entirety.
This Handbook surveys the development of the English novel during the 'long' eighteenth century-in other
words, from the later seventeenth century right through to the first three decades of the nineteenth century
when, with the publication of the novels of Jane Austen and Walter Scott, 'the novel' finally gained critical
acceptance and assumed the position of cultural hegemony it enjoyed for over a century. By situating the
novels of the period which are still read today against the background of the hundreds published between
1660 and 1830, this Handbook not only covers those 'masters and mistresses' of early prose fiction-such as
Defoe, Richardson, Fielding, Sterne, Burney, Scott and Austen-who are still acknowledged to be seminal
figures in the emergence and development of the English novel, but also the significant number of recently-
rediscovered novelists who were popular in their own day. At the same time, its comprehensive coverage of
cultural contexts not considered by any existing study, but which are central to the emergence of the novel,
such as the book trade and the mechanics of book production, copyright and censorship, the growth of the
reading public, the economics of culture both in London and in the provinces, and the re-printing of popular
fiction after 1774, offers unique insight into the making of the English novel.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Smith:

This The Oxford Handbook of the Eighteenth-Century Novel (Oxford Handbooks) usually are reliable for
you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The main reason of this The Oxford Handbook of
the Eighteenth-Century Novel (Oxford Handbooks) can be on the list of great books you must have is usually
giving you more than just simple reading food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Oxford Handbook of the Eighteenth-
Century Novel (Oxford Handbooks) forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary,
giving you tryout of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in
reading.

Curtis Phillips:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The The
Oxford Handbook of the Eighteenth-Century Novel (Oxford Handbooks) provide you with a new experience
in looking at a book.

Patrick Leon:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books.
Among the books in the top checklist in your reading list is The Oxford Handbook of the Eighteenth-Century
Novel (Oxford Handbooks). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in
turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this book you can get many advantages.

Betty Jordan:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This publication The Oxford Handbook of the Eighteenth-Century Novel
(Oxford Handbooks) was filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your
research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a book. If you know how big
advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways
to get book you wanted.
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