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Poetry. In this accomplished first collection, Erica McAlpine draws truths from the everyday, meditating
over contingency and luck and the often- vexed relationship we have to these things. The casual register of
her verse belies its formal complexity. Many of the poems are crafted in tight syntactical units of just one or
two sentences; others are composed in rhyming sapphics, a meter favoured by the poet Horace, whose
guiding voice recurs throughout the collection. Humorous and serious in turn, these quietly virtuosic poems
achieve lofty aims: to teach, to advise, to warn—to show, in the manner of a close friend, what the world has
to offer, what it sometimes takes away, and what can and should matter most.
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From reader reviews:

Dan Maes:

The event that you get from The Country Gambler may be the more deep you rooting the information that
hide within the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
know but The Country Gambler giving you joy feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in
particular way that can be understood by means of anyone who read it because the author of this publication
is well-known enough. That book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand
then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for
having this particular The Country Gambler instantly.

Joshua Montgomery:

The actual book The Country Gambler has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot
of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research previous to write this
book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

Charles Malone:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared to can satisfy
your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-book that need more time to
be learn. The Country Gambler can be your answer since it can be read by you who have those short free
time problems.

Teresa Thomas:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. Within
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying to
find the The Country Gambler when you desired it?
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