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The best selling study Bible in the King James Version—now updated, with added features. Trusted for
25 years, The King James Study Bible has dependable notes and annotations from scholars you can rely on,
led by General Editor Edward Hindson. A clear presentation of conservative Bible doctrine, with the
resources you need for knowing God’s Word.

Features include:

 

NEW: Fresh new page design for enjoyable reading of the Authorized King James text●

More than 5,700 authoritative and time-tested study notes offer straightforward communication and clear●

understanding
NEW: 48 revised in-text maps and charts - modernized and redrawn for stress-free reference●

Large, 11-point Bible type for comfort reading no matter how long you spend●

NEW: Enhanced concordance with added Hebrew and Greek word studies gives deeper insight●

NEW: Index of Christ and the Gospels●

NEW: Index of Paul and His Letters●

NEW: Index of Bible Prophecy●

Words of Christ in red●

Doctrinal and archaeological footnotes and personality profiles written by trusted, conservative pastors and●

Bible teachers
Comprehensive book introductions and outlines●

Center-column references with translation notes●

Complete index to annotations, doctrinal footnotes, personality profiles, and archaeological sites●

Part of the Signature Series line of Thomas Nelson Bibles

King James Study Bibles sold to date: More than 2.4 million

The King James Version—The most successful Bible translation in history with billions of copies
published
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From reader reviews:

Maria Jennings:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the character
types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this KJV Study
Bible, Large Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red Letter Edition: Second Edition, you may tells your family,
friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a
book.

Rita Carter:

The e-book untitled KJV Study Bible, Large Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red Letter Edition: Second
Edition is the guide that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be
shown to you. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they
share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of KJV Study Bible, Large
Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red Letter Edition: Second Edition from the publisher to make you
considerably more enjoy free time.

Corey Smith:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
means, more simple and reachable. This kind of KJV Study Bible, Large Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red
Letter Edition: Second Edition can give you a lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book you
have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step
for you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by
knowing more than various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let me have KJV Study
Bible, Large Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red Letter Edition: Second Edition.

Scott Hicks:

You can find this KJV Study Bible, Large Print, Bonded Leather, Black, Red Letter Edition: Second Edition
by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you
get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only simply by written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking of your
mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information
about your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to



choose appropriate ways for you.
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