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Norman Podhoretz, the son of Jewish immigrants, grew up in the tough Brownsville section of Brooklyn,
attended Columbia University on a scholarship, and later received degrees from the Jewish Theological
Seminary and Cambridge University. Making It is his blistering account of fighting his way out of Brooklyn
and into, then out of, the Ivory Tower, of his military service, and finally of his induction into the ranks of
what he calls “The Family,” the small group of left-wing and largely Jewish critics and writers whose
opinions came to dominate and increasingly politicize the American literary scene in the fifties and sixties. It
is a Balzacian story of raw talent and relentless and ruthless ambition. It is also a closely observed and in
many ways still pertinent analysis of the tense and more than a little duplicitous relationship that exists in
America between intellect and imagination, money, social status, and power.

The Family responded to Podhoretz’s book with outrage, and Podhoretz soon turned no less angrily on them,
becoming the fierce neoconservative he remains to this day. Fifty years after its first publication, this
controversial and legendary book remains a riveting autobiography, a book that can be painfully revealing
about the complex convictions and needs of a complicated man as well as a fascinating and essential
document of mid-century American cultural life.
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From reader reviews:

William Manwaring:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an individual is you
don't know which one you should start with. This Making It (NYRB Classics) is our recommendation to
cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Roger Bennett:

The particular book Making It (NYRB Classics) will bring someone to the new experience of reading the
book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to see, this book
very suitable to you. The book Making It (NYRB Classics) is much recommended to you to study. You can
also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Julie Harris:

Precisely why? Because this Making It (NYRB Classics) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to understand,
entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having
this anymore or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of advantages than the other
book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold up
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Doris Snell:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying
to find the Making It (NYRB Classics) when you needed it?
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