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This is the only English translation of this important book by the world's most distinguished Bach scholar.
This work is widely regarded as the most authoritative and comprehensive treatment of the Bach cantatas. It
begins with a historical survey of the seventeenth-century background to the cantatas, and performance
practice issues. The core of the book is a work-by-work study in which each cantata in turn is represented by
its libretto, a synopsis of its movements,
and a detailed analytical commentary. This format makes it extremely useful as a reference work for anyone
listening to, performing in, or studying any of the Bach cantatas.

All the cantata librettos are given in German-English parallel text. For the English edition the text has been
carefully revised to bring it up to date, taking account of recent Bach scholarship.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Diaz:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find guide that
need more time to be study. The Cantatas of J. S. Bach: With their librettos in German-English parallel text
can be your answer because it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Jessica Hodgkins:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The
Cantatas of J. S. Bach: With their librettos in German-English parallel text provide you with a new
experience in reading through a book.

Bruno Reed:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book The Cantatas of J. S. Bach: With their librettos in
German-English parallel text was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
The Cantatas of J. S. Bach: With their librettos in German-English parallel text has many kinds or variety.
Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe that you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try
to choose the best book for you and try to like reading this.

Helen Hanson:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the The Cantatas of J. S. Bach: With their librettos in German-English parallel text when you
required it?
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