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According to Xenophon, Socrates tried to persuade his associate Aristippus to moderate his excessive
indulgence in wine, women, and food, arguing that only hard work can bring happiness. Aristippus wasn't
convinced. Instead, he and his followers espoused the most radical form of hedonism in ancient Western
philosophy. Before the rise of the better known but comparatively ascetic Epicureans, the Cyrenaics pursued
a way of life in which moments of pleasure, particularly bodily pleasure, held the highest value. In The Birth
of Hedonism, Kurt Lampe provides the most comprehensive account in any language of Cyrenaic ideas and
behavior, revolutionizing the understanding of this neglected but important school of philosophy.

The Birth of Hedonism thoroughly and sympathetically reconstructs the doctrines and practices of the
Cyrenaics, who were active between the fourth and third centuries BCE. The book examines not only
Aristippus and the mainstream Cyrenaics, but also Hegesias, Anniceris, and Theodorus. Contrary to recent
scholarship, the book shows that the Cyrenaics, despite giving primary value to discrete pleasurable
experiences, accepted the dominant Greek philosophical belief that life-long happiness and the virtues that
sustain it are the principal concerns of ethics. The book also offers the first in-depth effort to understand
Theodorus's atheism and Hegesias's pessimism, both of which are extremely unusual in ancient Greek
philosophy and which raise the interesting question of hedonism's relationship to pessimism and atheism.
Finally, the book explores the "new Cyrenaicism" of the nineteenth-century writer and classicist Walter
Pater, who drew out the enduring philosophical interest of Cyrenaic hedonism more than any other modern
thinker.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Keating:

The book The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book
The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life? Some of you have a
different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right
now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, it is possible to give for each
other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic Philosophers and
Pleasure as a Way of Life has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can
seem the enormous world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Ronnie Miller:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of
you maybe will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This The Birth of Hedonism: The
Cyrenaic Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life is our recommendation so you keep up with the world.
Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Bryan Lewis:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them
is this The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life.

Steven Burley:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic
Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life to make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of
reading talent is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you
enjoy to read it and mingle the feeling about book and looking at especially. It is to be very first opinion for
you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that the book The Birth of Hedonism: The Cyrenaic
Philosophers and Pleasure as a Way of Life can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone



and confuse with the information must you're doing of that time.
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