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Cytogenetic Laboratory Management: Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-Based Best Practices and
Procedures is a practical guide that describes how to develop and implement best practice processes and
procedures in the genetic laboratory setting. The text first describes good laboratory practices, including
quality management, design control of tests and FDA guidelines for laboratory developed tests, and pre-
clinical validation study designs. The second focus of the book describes best practices for staffing and
training, including cost of testing, staffing requirements, process improvement using Six Sigma techniques,
training and competency guidelines and complete training programs for cytogenetic and molecular genetic
technologists. The third part of the text provides step-wise standard operating procedures for chromosomal,
FISH and microarray-based tests, including pre-analytic, analytic and post-analytic steps in testing, and
divided into categories by specimen type, and test-type.

All three sections of the book include example worksheets, procedures, and other illustrative examples that
can be downloaded from the Wiley website to be used directly without having to develop prototypes in your
laboratory.

Providing both a wealth of information on laboratory management and molecular and cytogenetic testing,
Cytogenetic Laboratory Management will be an essential tool for laboratorians world-wide in the field of
laboratory testing and genetics testing in particular.

This book gives the essentials of:

Developing and implementing good quality management programs in laboratories●

Understanding design control of tests and pre-clinical validations studies and reports●

FDA guidelines for laboratory developed tests●

Use of reagents, instruments and equipment●

Cost of testing assessment and process improvement using Six Sigma methodology●

Staffing training and competency objectives●

Complete training programs for molecular and cytogenetic technologists●

Standard operating procedures for all components of chromosomal analysis, FISH and microarray testing●

of different specimen types

This volume is a companion to Cytogenetic Abnormalities: Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-Based
Clinical Reporting. The combined volumes give an expansive approach to performing, reporting and
interpreting cytogenetic laboratory testing and the necessary management practices, staff and testing
requirements.
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From reader reviews:

Lydia Donaldson:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Cytogenetic Laboratory Management:
Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-Based Best Practices and Procedures as the daily resource information.

Kim Deyoung:

Typically the book Cytogenetic Laboratory Management: Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-Based Best
Practices and Procedures has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The
book was authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior to write this book. That
book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after reading this book.

Anthony Lucas:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you go through a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, and also soon. The Cytogenetic Laboratory Management: Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-
Based Best Practices and Procedures will give you new experience in studying a book.

Fay Harris:

You will get this Cytogenetic Laboratory Management: Chromosomal, FISH and Microarray-Based Best
Practices and Procedures by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it may to be
your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by
means of written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era like now,
you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own
ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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