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An insightful look at how Amazon really works and how its founder and CEO makes it happen.

Amazon's business model is deceptively simple: make online shopping so easy and convenient that
customers won't think twice. It can almost be summed up by the button on every page: Buy now with one
click.

Why has Amazon been so successful? Much of it has to do with Jeff Bezos, the CEO and founder, whose
business strategy and unique combination of character traits have driven Amazon to the top of the online
retail world. Originally a computer nerd rather than a businessman, he had the vision to capitalize on the
untapped online marketplace for bookselling and continues to discover new marketing opportunities, from
groceries to auto parts. He's a calculating machine, energetic, passionate, highly aggressive, and out to
radically transform retail.

Through numerous interviews with Amazon employees, competitors, and observers, Richard Brandt has
deciphered how Bezos thinks, what drives his actions, and how he makes decisions. Anyone in business can
learn a lot from the example of Amazon's ongoing evolution.
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From reader reviews:

Tamera Duckett:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They must answer that question simply
because just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of One Click: Jeff Bezos and the Rise of
Amazon.com to read.

Maureen Harris:

This book untitled One Click: Jeff Bezos and the Rise of Amazon.com to be one of several books in which
best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit onto it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.

Cynthia Harvell:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all
day every day to reading a guide. The book One Click: Jeff Bezos and the Rise of Amazon.com it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book.
If you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to
read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book offers high quality.

Donna Feuerstein:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love One Click: Jeff Bezos and the Rise of
Amazon.com, you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its identified as
reading friends.
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