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A wonderful miscellany of hundreds of interesting facts about Wales.
     The inspiration for the primetime ITV series on Great Britain, this is a spellbinding journey around Wales
by bestselling author Christopher Winn. Packed full of legends, firsts, birthplaces, inventions and adventures,
I Never Knew That About Wales visits the thirteen traditional Welsh counties and unearths the hidden gems
that they each hold. Discover where history and legends happened; where people, ideas and inventions
began; where dreams took flight; where famous figures were born and now rest. A glittering pantheon of
writers and artists, thinkers and inventors, heroes and villains have lived and toiled in this small country.
Remarkable events, noble (and dastardly) deeds and exciting adventures have all taken place with Wales as
their backdrop. This book seeks out their heritage, their monuments, their memories and their secrets.
     You'll be able to visit Britain's smallest city, St David's with its glorious 12th-century cathedral
slumbering in a sleepy hollow near the sea. Explore Britain's greatest collection of castles from the first stone
fortress at Chepstow to Britain's finest concentric castle at Beaumaris and the magnificent Caernarvon,
birthplace of the first Prince of Wales. Browse through the second hand book capital of the world, Hay-on-
Wye, wander the glorious Gower peninsula, Britain's first Area of Outstanding Natural Beauty. Take a trip to
Fishguard, where the last invasion of Britain took place in 1797. Marvel at Thomas Telford's Menai Bridge,
the world's first iron suspension bridge or Pontcysyllte, the longest bridged aqueduct in Britain.
     This irresistible compendium of interesting facts and good stories will give you a captivating insight into
the people, ideas and events that have shaped the individual identity of every place you visit, and will have
you exclaiming again and again: 'Well, I never knew that!'
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From reader reviews:

Peggy Ross:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand up than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of I Never Knew That
About Wales book as basic and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Ezra Talbott:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping I Never Knew That
About Wales that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading
habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how
they react to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but
for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit,
you are able to pick I Never Knew That About Wales become your personal starter.

Tony Valdez:

The book untitled I Never Knew That About Wales contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains
her idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not
worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the
new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-
book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

Douglas Brownlee:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book I Never Knew That About Wales to make your
current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the idea about book and examining especially. It is
to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and read it. Beside that the guide I Never Knew That
About Wales can to be a newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of the time.
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