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Josef Albers (1888-1976) was a highly influential painter, color theorist and teacher--a monumental figure in
international postwar art and aesthetics; his wife and artistic equal, Anni Albers (1899-1994), created
important textile artworks as well as spare and abstract paintings and drawings. Together, their artistic roots
can be traced to the time they shared at the Bauhaus in Germany in the 1920s and early 1930s. After
immigrating to the United States in 1933, the couple traveled regularly to Mexico and South America to
study the art, architecture and textile designs of pre-Columbian cultures.
Featuring previously unseen letters, manuscripts and photographs by the artists, as well as lush color plates
of their artworks, this catalogue is the first to document the influence of Central and South America on the
Albers' work. It also makes the case that their art, as we know it today, cannot be understood without
acknowledging their pivotal encounters in Latin America, for Anni's weavings, drawings and painted studies
demonstrate her deep knowledge of pre-Colombian textiles, and Josef's paintings and photographs testify to
the development of his unique sense of color in Mexico, as well as the formation of his independent concepts
of photography and Formalism. One particularly stunning chapter, Hommage to the Pyramid  includes Josef
Albers' photographic collages of South American Meso-American pyramids. The abstract, graphic quality of
these images refers directly and surprisingly to both artists' paintings and textiles.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Richards:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Anni and Josef Albers: Latin American
Journeys book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred
pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Aubrey Smith:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their story or perhaps
their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are many
kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their skill in writing, they
also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this Anni and Josef Albers:
Latin American Journeys.

Paul Leavens:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the reserve untitled Anni and Josef Albers: Latin American Journeys can be
fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Shelia Tonn:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or
real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't
see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally.
As we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Anni and Josef Albers: Latin American Journeys can make you truly feel
more interested to read.
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