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This book explores the role of emotions and affections in the Christian tradition from historical and
theological perspectives, especially related to the work of the Holy Spirit. Although historians and scholars
from a range of traditions—including Wesleyan, Pentecostal, and Pietist—have engaged these issues, there
has yet to be a sustained examination of the role of emotions and affectivity across the Christian tradition. By
retrieving the complex discussion about affectivity in Christian tradition and bringing its many voices into
dialogue within a contemporary ecumenical context, the contributors also point toward a number of new
research trajectories. The essays underscore the need to understand the shift in Western views of emotion
that began in the late eighteenth century. They also explore in detail the vocabulary of affectivity as it has
developed in the Christian tradition. As part of this development, the contributors reveal the importance of
pneumatology in Western as well as Eastern Christianity, calling into question the idea of a pneumatological
deficit advanced by some constructive theologians and addressing the relationship between affectivity and
the pedagogical strategies that enable persons to cooperate with the work of grace in the soul. Finally, several
essays explore the relationship between the erotic, the ecstatic, and affectivity in religious belief. This
volume will interest scholars and students of historical theology, of emotions in theology, and of Christian
renewal or charismatic movements.

"This volume makes an original and substantial contribution to the related fields of history of Christianity
and historical theology. The twelve essays gathered here present a compelling and interesting case for what
Yong calls 'a renewalist historiographic method' in these disciplines. This is an indispensable collection for
scholars and students alike." —Franklin T. Harkins, Boston College School of Theology and Ministry
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From reader reviews:

Amado Spieker:

The book The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian Tradition make one feel enjoy for your spare time.
You may use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to become your best friend when
you getting pressure or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading through a book
The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian Tradition to become your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You
can know everything if you like wide open and read a book The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian
Tradition. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this guide?

Lawrence Gibbs:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian Tradition this e-book consist
a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can the
world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Typically the
writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That is why this book suited all of you.

Jessica Bradburn:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This guide The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian Tradition was filled in relation to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to
read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Nathaniel Mitchell:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information coming
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of news. With
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
just like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the The Spirit, the Affections, and the Christian Tradition when you essential it?
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